APRIL 15,1960

Pursuant to a call by the Mayor the City Council of the City of Idaho Falls met in Special
Session in the Mayor’s Chambers on April 15, 1960 at 11:00 A.M. for the purpose of opening sealed
bids on certain waterworks material and also, sealed bids on certain transformers and meters. There
were present at said Meeting: Mayor Pro-tem Vernon Johnson; Councilmen Foote, Creek. Absent:
Mayor W. J. O'Bryant and Councilman Petersen. Also present: Roy C. Barnes, City Clerk; Don
Lloyd, City Engineer; Boyd Wright, Purchasing Agent.

The Mayor Pro-tem announced that this was the time and the place for the opening of sealed
bids on certain waterworks materials for the Rollandet Avenue water main and instructed the City
Clerk to proceed. The following were revealed:

Cast Iron Pipe Pipe Appurtenances

Waterworks Equipment Co.

Pocatello, Idaho $23,043.05 $3,114.60
Ludlow Waterworks Supply Co.

Salt Lake City, Utah No Bid 2,665.40
Wisco Associates

Salt Lake City, Utah No Bid 2,965.56

It was then moved by Councilman Creek, seconded by Foote, that Waterworks Equipment be
awarded the contract on the cast iron pipe and Ludlow Waterworks Supply the bid on the pipe
appurtenances. Roll call as follows: Ayes, 3; No, None; carried.

The Mayor Pro-tem then announced that this was the time and the place for the opening of
sealed bids on certain transformers and meters and instructed the City Clerk to proceed. The
following were revealed:

15 KV A Transformer 25 KVA Meters

Electrical Contractors

Unit price - $245.00

Unit Price - $338.00

Unit Price - $17.70

Supply Co., Idaho Falls (Line Material) (Line Material) (Duncan)
$245.03 - Pennsylvania | $338.65 - Pennsylvania $17.70 (Sangamo)
$231.00 (Uptegraff) $320.00 (Uptegraff)
Pole Line Dist. Comp. $240.00 $335.00 $17.30
Salt Lake City, Utah
Westinghouse  Electric $245.00 $338.00 $17.70 (Style 1M 146G?7)

Supply Co., Salt Lake

$15.90 (Style 2 P2G 10)
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Allis Chalmers $240.00 $332.00 No Bid
Salt Lake City, Utah

General Elec. Supply Co. $245.00 $338.00 $17.70
Salt Lake City, Utah

R T & E Corp. $238.00 $329.00 No Bid
Portland, Oregon

These were referred to the Electrical Engineer and the Purchasing Agent who will analyze all
bids thoroughly for such intangibles on loss factor, efficiency, etc. and finally make their
recommendations accordingly.

There being no further business, it was moved by Councilman Creek, seconded by Foote, that
the Council adjourn, carried.

ATTEST: s/ Roy C. Barnes s/ W.]. O’'Brvant
CITY CLERK MAYOR
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