
 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  The City Council of the City of Idaho Falls met in Regular Council Meeting, 
Thursday, July 23, 1998, in the Council Chambers at 140 South Capital Avenue in Idaho 
Falls, Idaho. 
 
  There were present: 
 
  Mayor Linda Milam 
  Councilmember Brad Eldredge 
  Councilmember Larry Carlson 
  Councilmember Gary Mills 
  Councilmember Joe Groberg 
  Councilmember Beverly Branson 
  Councilmember Ida Hardcastle 
 
  Also present: 
 
  Dale Storer, City Attorney 
  Rosemarie Anderson, City Clerk 
  All available Division Directors 
 
  Mayor Milam and City Council honored Darwin Kinghorn, retiree from the 
Airport, by presenting him with a watch. 

 The City Clerk read a summary of the minutes for the July 9, 1998 Regular 
Meeting.  It was moved by Councilmember Branson, seconded by Councilmember Eldredge, 
that the minutes be approved as read.  Roll call as follows:   
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
 
  Nay:   None  
 
  Motion Carried. 
 

CONSENT AGENDA ITEMS 
 
  The City Clerk presented several license applications, including BARTENDER 
PERMITS to Jerry A. Campbell, Karmen J. Haras, and James L. Thomas, all carrying the 
required approvals, and requested authorization to issue these licenses. 
  The City Clerk requested Council ratification for the publication of legal notices 
calling for public hearings on July 23, 1998. 
  The Municipal Services Director submitted the following memo: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 



 

 

MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: S. Craig Lords, Municipal Services Director 
SUBJECT: CITY HALL EXTERIOR RENOVATION ADVERTISEMENT 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

Municipal Services respectfully requests authorization to advertise and receive 
bids for renovating the exterior of City Hall. 
 
        s/ S. Craig Lords 
 

  It was moved by Councilmember Branson, seconded by Councilmember 
Eldredge, to approve the Consent Agenda in accordance with the recommendations 
presented.  Roll call as follows:   
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
 
  Nay:   None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 

REGULAR AGENDA ITEMS 
 
  Mayor Milam requested Councilmember Mills to conduct Annexation 
Proceedings for H-S Addition, Division No. 1.  At the request of Councilmember Mills, the City 
Clerk read the following memo from the Planning and Building Director: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 9, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Renée R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 
SUBJECT: ANNEXATION, FINAL PLAT, INITIAL ZONING, AND SITE PLAN 
  APPROVAL FOR H-S ADDITION, DIVISION NO. 1 
 
Attached is a copy of the Annexation Ordinance, Final Plat, and Site Plan for  
H-S Addition, Division No. 1.  The Final Plat contains 25.22 acres and 13 lots.  
The property is located northwest of the intersection of Woodruff Avenue and 
First Street.  The requested zoning is RSC-1, Residential Shopping Center.  The 
Planning Commission reviewed the annexation request in May and 
recommended approval upon the condition the concrete wall on the northern 
edge of the property be included in the Annexation Agreement.  At its June 
Meeting, the Commission reviewed the site plan and recommended approval 
upon the completion of seven conditions, all of which have since been 
incorporated into the Final Plat and Site Plan.  The Annexation Agreement was 
approved at the last Council Meeting, pending approval of the Annexation 
Ordinance, Final Plat, and initial zoning.  These matters are now being 
submitted to the Mayor and Council for consideration. 
 



 

 

        s/ Renée R. Magee 
 

The Planning and Building Director located the subject area on a map and further explained 
the request.  Following is a list of exhibits used in connection with this Annexation request: 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Slide 1 Vicinity Map of area showing surrounding zones. 
  Exhibit 1 
 
  Slide 2 Final Plat for H-S Addition, Division No. 1 
  Exhibit 2 
 
  Slide 3 Aerial Photo showing land uses surrounding H-S Addition. 
  Exhibit 3 
 
  Slide 4 Elevation of the proposed Waremart Building. 
  Exhibit 4 
 
  Slide 5 Site Plan reviewed by Planning Commission. 
  Exhibit 5 
 
  Slide 6 Site Plan that Staff is reviewing, showing what the Developers 
  Exhibit 6 are proposing with the first phase of development. 
 
  Councilmember Mills requested a representative of the Developer to appear at 
this time. 
  Paul Simmons, 3601 State Street, Salem, Oregon, appeared to state that he is 
the Vice President of Retail Development for Waremart Foods.  He stated that Waremart is 
ready to start construction of the wall along the north side of the property as early as 
Monday, if everything is approved at this Council Meeting.  Mr. Simmons further clarified 
that additional negotiations for work have taken place with surrounding neighbors.  On the 
planting burm along the back of the Waremart building, there will be a 6-foot cedar fence 
installed to aid in noise abatement for the 4-plexes that will be located there. 
  Mayor Milam questioned the Electric Division Director as to whether the traffic 
signal located for this development would tie into the Woodruff loop, in terms of the timing 
for First Street and Woodruff Avenue.  Mr. Gendron stated that this signal would tie into the 
Woodruff loop and the traffic signal would fall into that timing. 
  Councilmember Groberg requested clarification as to whether the traffic light 
would be installed at the completion of the development, or whether it would be installed 
earlier.  He stated that it would seem appropriate to install the traffic signal at the completion 
of this development. 
  Brian Huffaker, representative from Hawkins-Smith (Developers), 8645 West 
Franklin Road, Boise, Idaho, appeared to state that he read through the traffic report.  It was 
determined that all of the construction work relating to the traffic signal would be completed, 
so that the light would be ready for operation when it is warranted. 
  Councilmember Mills requested those present who wished to speak in favor of 
this development to appear at this time. 
  There being no one who wished to speak in favor of this development, 
Councilmember Mills requested those present who wished to speak in opposition to this 
development to come forward. 
  Val Erickson, 1710 Garfield Street, appeared to state that he is really not 
opposed to this development.  They had a neighborhood meeting, where Waremart Foods and 
Hawkins-Smith Development Company met with the neighbors to discuss concerns relating 
to the Waremart Development.  Mr. Erickson requested of the Mayor and City Council to 
have the following letter addressing some of the agreements that Waremart made with 
neighbors, made a part of the record for this public hearing: 



 

 

 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        May 8, 1998 
 
Mr. Val Erickson 
1710 Garfield Street 
Idaho Falls, Idaho  83401 
 
RE: Results of Neighborhood Meeting 
 
Thank you for taking the time out of your schedule to meeting with us on 
Tuesday evening.  We felt that everyone left the meeting with all of their 
questions answered, and their requests granted.  The obvious topic of 
discussion was the construction of a block wall between our properties and the 
closure of Kelsey Drive.  In response to your requests, we committed to provide 
the following: 
 
1) A continuous block wall 8’ in height, with some type of decorative 

pattern, 
2) To extend the wall completely past Kelsey Drive, 
3) To construct the wall as quickly as possible when construction begins, 

and 
4) To require a dust abatement program with our Contractor. 

 
Items 1, 2, and 3, are conditioned on approval from the City.  I have spoken 
with Reneé R. Magee regarding the outcome of our meeting to make her aware 
of what you are requesting.  I really do not expect any opposition from the 
Planning Commission or City Council since these requests are made by you 
rather than from us. 
 
Thank you again for your attendance and participation in our development.  If 
you have any further questions regarding this project, please do not hesitate to 
call me at 208-376-8521. 
 
Sincerely, 
HAWKINS-SMITH DEVELOPMENT COMPANY 
 
s/ Brian D. Huffaker 
Brian D. Huffaker 
Development Manager 
 
cc:  Paul Simmons, Waremart 
      Reneé R. Magee, City of Idaho Falls 
 

  There being no further discussion, it was moved by Councilmember Mills, 
seconded by Councilmember Groberg, to accept the Final Plat for H-S Addition, Division No. 
1 and, further, give authorization for the Mayor, City Engineer, City Surveyor, and City Clerk 
to sign said Plat.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 



 

 

    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  At the request of Councilmember Mills, the City Attorney read the following 
Ordinance by title: 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 2281 
 

AN ORDINANCE ANNEXING CERTAIN LANDS TO 
THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO; DESCRIBING 
THESE LANDS; REQUIRING THE FILING OF THE 
ORDINANCE AND AMENDED CITY MAP AND 
AMENDED LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF THE CITY 
WITH THE APPROPRIATE COUNTY AND STATE 
AUTHORITIES; AND ESTABLISHING EFFECTIVE 
DATE. 

 
The foregoing Ordinance was presented by title only.  Councilmember Mills moved, and 
Councilmember Groberg seconded, that the provisions of Idaho Code Section 50-902 
requiring all Ordinances to be read by title, and once in full, on three separate dates be 
dispensed with and the Ordinance be passed on all three readings.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried.  

 
  A public hearing was conducted to consider the initial zoning of the newly 
annexed area.  There being no discussion, it was moved by Councilmember Mills, seconded 
by Councilmember Groberg, to establish the initial zoning of H-S Addition, Division No. 1 as 
RSC-1 as requested, and that the comprehensive plan be amended to include the area 
annexed herewith, and that the City Planner be instructed to reflect said annexation, zoning 
and amendment to the comprehensive plan on the comprehensive plan and zoning maps 
located in the Planning Office.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Branson 
 
  Nay:  None 



 

 

 
  Motion Carried. 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Mayor Milam requested Councilmember Mills to conduct a public hearing to 
consider a rezone from R-3A (Apartments and Office Buildings) to RSC-1 (Residential 
Shopping Center) of Lots 1 through 8, Block 2, Bonita Park Addition, Division No. 1, located 
generally on the west side of Woodruff Avenue, south of Garfield Street, and north of First 
Street.  At the request of Councilmember Mills, the City Clerk read the following memo from 
the Planning and Building Director: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 6, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Reneé R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 
SUBJECT: REZONING REQUEST FOR LOTS 1-8, BLOCK 2, BONITA PARK 
  ADDITION 
 
Attached is the application to rezone Lots 1-8, Block 2, Bonita Park Addition 
from R-3A (Apartments and Offices) to RSC-1 (Residential Shopping Center).  
This request covers approximately 2.11 acres immediately west of and adjacent 
to Woodruff Avenue and approximately 500 feet north of First Street.  The 
Planning Commission recommended approval of this request at its June 9, 
1998 Meeting.  The Department concurs in this recommendation, and the 
matter is now being submitted to the Mayor and Council for consideration. 
 
        s/ Reneé R. Magee 
 

The Planning and Building Director located the subject area on a map and further explained 
the request.  Following is a list of exhibits used in connection with this rezoning request: 
 
  Slide 1 Vicinity Map of area showing surrounding zoning. 
  Exhibit 1 
 
  Slide 2 Actual site of Waremart Development. 
  Exhibit 2 
 
  Slide 3 Area to immediate east of Waremart Development along Woodruff 
  Exhibit 3 Avenue. 
 
  Slide 4 Area to the south of Waremart Development along Woodruff 
  Exhibit 4 Avenue. 
 
  Councilmember Mills questioned the Planning and Building Director as to how 
close to residential property construction could be.  The Planning and Building Director 
explained that a building could be constructed to within 30 feet from the residential zone, 
and that the setback requirement from the street is 50 feet. 
  Brian Huffaker, representative from Hawkins-Smith Development Company, 
8645 West Franklin Road, Boise, Idaho, appeared to state that everything has been designed 
to be in accordance with the setback requirements. 



 

 

  Val Erickson, 1710 Garfield Street, re-appeared to question whether the 8-foot 
block wall will cross Kelsey Street.  The Planning and Building Director stated that the 8-foot 
block wall will be constructed across Kelsey Drive. 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Councilmember Mills questioned as to how far to the east does the 8-foot block 
wall extend.  The Planning and Building Director stated that this wall will be constructed to 
within 15-feet of Woodruff Avenue. 
  It was moved by Councilmember Mills, seconded by Councilmember Groberg, to 
approve the zone change from R-3A (Apartments and Office Buildings) to RSC-1 (Residential 
Shopping Center), and that the City Planner be instructed to reflect said zoning change on 
the official zoning map located in the Planning Office.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  Mayor Milam requested Councilmember Mills to conduct a public hearing to 
consider a rezone from R-1 (Single-Family Residential) to RSC-1 (Residential Shopping 
Center) on approximately 2.1 acres in the Southwest Corner of Section 16, Township 2 
North, Range 38, East of the Boise Meridian, located generally on the north side of First 
Street and on the east side of the Idaho Canal.  At the request of Councilmember Mills, the 
City Clerk read the following memo from the Planning and Building Director: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 6, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Reneé R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 
SUBJECT: REZONING REQUEST FOR METES AND BOUNDS, FIRST STREET 
 
Attached is the application to rezone approximately 2.1 acres from R-1, Single 
Family Residential, to RSC-1, Residential Shopping Center.  The property is 
approximately 600 feet west of Woodruff Avenue and immediately north and 
adjacent to First Street.  This proposal is a portion of the property proposed 
from H-S Addition.  The Planning Commission recommended approval of this 
request at its June 9, 1998 Meeting.  The Department concurs in this 
recommendation, and the matter is now being submitted to the Mayor and 
Council for consideration. 
 
        s/ Reneé R. Magee 
 

The Planning and Building Director located the subject area on a map and further explained 
the request.  Following is a list of exhibits used in connection with this rezoning request: 
 
  Slide 1 Vicinity Map of area showing surrounding zoning. 



 

 

  Exhibit 1 
 
  Slide 2 Actual Site looking north across the site under consideration for 
  Exhibit 2 rezoning. 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Slide 3 Actual Site looking east. 
  Exhibit 3 
 
  Slide 4 Actual Site looking southeast to Smith’s Shopping Center. 
  Exhibit 4 
 
There being no discussion either in favor of or in opposition to this rezoning request, it was 
moved by Councilmember Mills, seconded by Councilmember Groberg, to grant the zone 
change from R-1 (Single-Family Residential) to RSC-1 (Residential Shopping Center), and 
that the City Planner be instructed to reflect said zoning change on the official zoning map 
located in his office.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
   
  Nay:  None 
   
  Motion Carried. 
 
  Mayor Milam requested Councilmember Mills to conduct Annexation 
Proceedings for Reed Addition, Division No. 1.  At the request of Councilmember Mills, the 
City Clerk read the following memo from the Planning and Building Director: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Reneé R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 
SUBJECT: ANNEXATION, FINAL PLAT, AND INITIAL ZONING OF REED 
  ADDITION, DIVISION NO. 1 
 
Attached is the Final Plat, Annexation Agreement, Annexation Ordinance, and 
request for initial zoning for Reed Addition, Division No. 1.  R-1 Zoning is 
requested on Lot 1 and R-3 is requested on Lot 2.  Both lots have a P. U. D. 
Overlay.  The property consists of 2.53 acres and access is provided through H-
S Addition.  The Planning Commission considered this request at its May 19th 
Meeting and recommended approval.  The Planning Department concurs in this 
recommendation.  The request is now being submitted to the Mayor and City 
Council for consideration. 
 
        s/ Reneé R. Magee 
 

Councilmember Mills expressed his appreciation to the Developers of this area for their good 
work in communicating with the neighbors regarding this development.   



 

 

  The Planning and Building Director located the subject area and further 
explained the request.  Following is a list of exhibits used in connection with this annexation 
request: 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Slide 1 Vicinity Map of area and surrounding zones. 
  Exhibit 1 
 
  Slide 2 Aerial photo of area. 
  Exhibit 2 
 
  Slide 3 Final Plat for Reed Addition, Division No. 1. 
  Exhibit 3 
 
  Councilmember Groberg questioned whether the County island will be 
addressed in the future.  The Planning and Building Director stated that the property owners 
are intending to bring this County island into the City in the near future. 
  Councilmember Carlson asked where the sewer line would be connected. 
  Larry Hudson, Mountain River Engineering, 1020 Lincoln Road, appeared to 
explain that the sewer line into this area is a tributary to a sewer line that will be extended 
approximately 300 feet down First Street.  He explained, further, that this line as well as the 
line for H-S Addition will be served by the same tributary sewer line. 
  Elizabeth Woods, 1573 Garfield Street, appeared to question whether there 
would be any additional water pressure added to this area to handle the new development.  
She stated that she is having trouble with water pressure at her home now. 
  Mayor Milam indicated that the Public Works Director will check into this and 
will notify her of the results of that inquiry. 
  Larry Hudson, Mountain River Engineering, re-appeared to explain that the 
water pressure in the area will be increased because the new water line will be an 8-inch line, 
which will tie into a dead-end line and will create more water pressure for the area. 
  There being no further discussion, it was moved by Councilmember Mills, 
seconded by Councilmember Groberg, to accept the Final Plat for Reed Addition, Division No. 
1 and, further, give authorization for the Mayor, City Engineer, City Surveyor, and City Clerk 
to sign the Final Plat.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  It was moved by Councilmember Mills, seconded by Councilmember Groberg, to 
approve the Annexation Agreement for Reed Addition, Division No. 1 and, further, give 
authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the Agreement.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 



 

 

    Councilmember Eldredge 
 
  Nay:  None 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  At the request of Councilmember Mills, the City Attorney read the following 
Ordinance by title: 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 2282 
 

AN ORDINANCE ANNEXING CERTAIN LANDS TO 
THE CITY OF IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO; DESCRIBING 
THESE LANDS; REQUIRING THE FILING OF THE 
ORDINANCE AND AMENDED CITY MAP AND 
AMENDED LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF THE CITY 
WITH THE APPROPRIATE COUNTY AND STATE 
AUTHORITIES; AND ESTABLISHING EFFECTIVE 
DATE. 

 
The foregoing Ordinance was presented by title only.  Councilmember Mills moved, and 
Councilmember Groberg seconded, that the provisions of Idaho Code Section 50-902 
requiring all Ordinances to be read by title, and once in full, on three separate dates be 
dispensed with and the Ordinance be passed on all three readings.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Branson 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried.  

 
  A public hearing was conducted to consider the initial zoning of the newly 
annexed area.  There being no discussion, it was moved by Councilmember Mills, seconded 
by Councilmember Groberg, to establish the initial zoning of Reed Addition, Division No. 1 as 
R-1 (Single-Family Residential) with a P. U. D. (Planned Unit Development) Overlay on Lot 1 
and R-3 (Apartments) with P. U. D. Overlay on Lot 2 as requested, and that the 
comprehensive plan be amended to include the area annexed herewith, and that the City 
Planner be instructed to reflect said annexation, zoning and amendment to the 
comprehensive plan on the comprehensive plan and zoning maps located in the Planning 
Office.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
 
  Nay:  None 



 

 

 
  Motion Carried. 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Mayor Milam requested Councilmember Mills to conduct Annexation 
Proceedings for Community Ice Rink, Division No. 1.  At the request of Councilmember Mills, 
the City Clerk read the following memo from the Planning and Building Director: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 21, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Reneé R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 
SUBJECT: ANNEXATION, FINAL PLAT, INITIAL ZONING, AND SITE PLAN 
  REVIEW FOR COMMUNITY ICE RINK, DIVISION NO. 1 
 
Attached is the Final Plat, Annexation Agreement, Annexation Ordinance, and 
request for initial zoning for Community Ice Rink, Division No. 1.  The property 
contains 6.83 acres, and the requested zoning is RSC-1, Residential Shopping 
Center.  Also, included with the request is site plan approval.  The Planning 
Commission considered this request at its May 12 Meeting and recommended 
approval.  This matter was advertised for this Council Meeting; however, the 
Idaho Falls Youth Management Association does not own the property, and the 
staff is requesting that this matter be recessed until August 13, 1998. 
 
        s/ Reneé R. Magee 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Mills, seconded by Councilmember Groberg, to recess the 
Annexation Proceedings for Community Ice Rink, Division No. 1 to the August 13, 1998 
Regular Council Meeting.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  Mayor Milam requested Councilmember Mills to conduct a public hearing to 
consider a rezone from R-3A (Apartments and Office Buildings) to C-1 (Limited Commercial) 
of Lots 2 and 3, Block 102, Rose Nielson Addition, Division No. 102, located generally on the 
south side of East 17th Street, and east of Hoopes Avenue.  At the request of Councilmember 
Mills, the City Clerk read the following memo from the Planning and Building Director: 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Reneé R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 
SUBJECT: REZONING REQUEST, LOTS 2 AND 3, BLOCK 102, ROSE 
  ROSE NIELSON ADDITION, DIVISION NO. 102 
 
Attached is the application for rezoning for Lots 2 and 3, Block 102, Rose 
Nielson Addition, Division No. 102, from R-3A to C-1.  The proposed use on the 
two existing properties is retail.  The Comprehensive Plan shows this property 
as commercial.  The Planning Commission considered this request at its June 
Meeting and recommended approval.  The Planning Department concurs in this 
recommendation.  The request is now being submitted to the Mayor and 
Council for consideration. 
 
        s/ Reneé R. Magee 
 

The Planning and Building Director located the subject area on a map and further explained 
the request.  Following is a list of exhibits used in connection with this rezoning request: 
 
  Slide 1 Vicinity Map illustrating zoning of surrounding area. 
  Exhibit 1 
 
  Slide 2 Aerial photo illustrating land uses in the area. 
  Exhibit 2 
 
  Eric Farr, Farr’s Jewelry, 1950 Virginia Avenue, appeared to state that this zone 
change will make the block between Hoopes Avenue and Channing Way consistent in zoning.  
They feel that Farr’s Jewelry is low-volume retail and would not generate a large amount of 
traffic to the area.  The building, as it now sits is landscaped nicely, and would continue to 
be maintained.  Mr. Farr explained that the lights in the parking area do not shine into the 
neighborhood and would not be left on all night.  He stated that they would not be adding a 
larger sign, but would be using the existing sign. 
  Beth Milam, 1949 Malibu Drive, appeared to question what the C-1 (Limited 
Commercial) Zone would allow.  She is concerned about what other types of businesses 
would be allowed in this building, if Farr’s Jewelry should decide to sell the building at a 
later date. 
  Councilmember Mills explained that the Mall is in a C-1 Zone, so that would be 
a good comparison as to what types of businesses would be allowed. 
  The Planning and Building Director stated that this zone would not allow such 
uses as auto sales, auto garages, bars, or taverns.  She explained, further, that there would 
be certain uses that would be difficult to put on the site, because of the parking requirements 
for certain uses. 
  It was moved by Councilmember Mills, seconded by Councilmember Groberg, to 
grant the zone change from R-3A (Apartments and Office Buildings) to C-1 (Limited 
Commercial) as requested on Lots 2 and 3, Block 102, Rose Nielson Addition, Division No. 



 

 

102 and that the City Planner be instructed to reflect said zoning change on the official 
zoning map located in the Planning Office.  Roll call as follows: 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  Mayor Milam indicated that this was the time for citizens to appear who had 
issues for the City Council that are not otherwise listed on the Agenda. 
  Donald Suckling, 1545 Clair View Lane, appeared to express his concern over 
the loud stereos in vehicles.  He also expressed his concern over vehicles speeding on City 
streets. 
  Councilmember Groberg stated that Mr. Suckling could make his suggestions 
in letter form and bring them to the Mayor’s Office to distribute to City Council.  
Councilmember Hardcastle invited Mr. Suckling to attend a Public Safety Council Committee 
Meeting to voice his suggestions on handling these problems. 
  The Electric Division Director submitted the following memos: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Mark Gendron, Electric Division Director 
SUBJECT: HATCH PROPERTY ACQUISITION 
 
Attached for your consideration is a “Contract of Sale” for the acquisition of 
property in the Bel-Aire Subdivision adjacent to the Idaho Canal off West 
Bonneville Drive.  The Electric Division intends to use this property to relocate 
the 9th Street Substation. 
 
The Electric Division recommends approval and authorization for the Mayor to 
sign this Agreement. 
 
        s/ Mark Gendron 
 

Councilmember Eldredge explained that the relocation of the 9th Street Substation will 
improve electric service to that portion of the City.  He explained, further, that the Substation 
will take 1/3 to 1/2 of the property, with the rest of the land being used for possibly a park. 
  Councilmember Groberg questioned as to what will happen to the 9th Street 
Substation.   
  The Electric Division Director stated that a portion of the 9th Street Substation 
will remain in service.  The construction of the new substation will begin in the 1999-2000 
budget year.  The transformer will be purchased out of the 1998-1999 budget year, with 
construction beginning at a later date. 



 

 

  It was moved by Councilmember Eldredge, seconded by Councilmember Mills, 
to approve the Contract of Sale between Joan Louise Hatch and John Mark Hatch and the 
City of Idaho Falls and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the 
necessary documents.  Roll call as follows: 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Mark Gendron, Electric Division Director 
SUBJECT: GTA SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT 
 
Attached for your consideration is a Letter Agreement implementing the GTA 
Settlement Agreement with the Bonneville Power Administration (B. P. A.).  This 
Agreement provides for compensation from B. P. A. for transmission costs from 
third parties relating to the delivery of non-federal power to the City.  The City 
Attorney has reviewed this Agreement. 
 
The Electric Division requests approval and authorization for the Mayor to 
execute this Agreement. 
 
        s/ Mark Gendron 
 

Following a brief explanation of the necessity of this Agreement, Councilmember Eldredge 
recognized Rod Aho, Account Executive with Bonneville Power Administration.  There being 
no further discussion, it was moved by Councilmember Eldredge, seconded by 
Councilmember Mills, to approve the Letter Agreement implementing the GTA Settlement 
Agreement with Bonneville Power Administration and, further, give authorization for the 
Mayor to execute the necessary documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  The Municipal Services Director submitted the following memo: 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: S. Craig Lords, Municipal Services Director 
SUBJECT: AUCTION SALE TO DISPOSE OF IMPOUNDED, UNCLAIMED, 
  AND SURPLUS MERCHANDISE 
 
Municipal Services respectfully requests authorization to conduct a City 
Auction Sale for impounded, unclaimed, and City surplus merchandise.  The 
sale is scheduled for Saturday, August 15, 1998 at 11:00 a.m. 
 
Municipal Services also respectfully requests to retain Great Western Auction 
International to set up said auction, tag merchandise, provide crew to man the 
auction and provide accounting of sales and proceeds at the cost of ten percent 
(10%) of net proceeds if auction total is over $5,000.00, or twelve percent (12%) 
of net proceeds if the auction total is under $5,000.00. 
 
        s/ S. Craig Lords 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Branson, seconded by Councilmember Eldredge, to give 
authorization to conduct a City Auction Sale for impounded, unclaimed, and City surplus 
merchandise and, further, to retain Great Western Auction International to set up said 
auction, tag merchandise, provide crew to man the auction, and provide accounting of sales 
and proceeds at the cost of ten percent (10%) of net proceeds if auction total is over 
$5,000.00, or twelve percent (12%) of net proceeds if the auction total is under $5,000.00.  
Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge  
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  The Planning and Building Director submitted the following memos: 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Renée R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 



 

 

SUBJECT: UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE 
 
Attached is a copy of the Ordinance adopting the 1997 Edition of the Uniform 
Plumbing Code. This is the latest edition of the Code and, with the adoption of 



 

 

 
JULY 23, 1998 

___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

this Ordinance, shall be effective August 1, 1998.  The Planning Department 
respectfully requests approval of this Ordinance, and it is being submitted for 
consideration by the Mayor and City Council. 
 
        s/ Renée R. Magee 
 

The Planning and Building Director stated that the Building Department always adopts the 
latest version of the Building Code, Electrical Code, Mechanical Code, and Plumbing Code.  
Adopting the latest Editions of each Code makes it easier on the Contractors.  The Planning 
and Building Director introduced Russ Goyen, Plumbing Inspector, for the City to explain 
this 1997 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code.  Mr. Goyen explained that due to political 
issues between the Code-writing Organizations, there are a number of amendments to this 
Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code.  The Plumbing Code-writing body is IAPMO 
(International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials).  The other Code-writing 
body is ICBO (International Council of Building Officials), who writes the Building Code and 
Mechanical Code adopted by the City of Idaho Falls.  He explained, further, that in order to 
gain more clout for the IAPMO Code, more and more items that do not belong in the 
Plumbing Code are being adopted.  Mr. Goyen submitted the following memo, which explains 
some of the amendments to the 1997 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code: 
 

        May 7, 1998 
 
The Building Department will soon be presenting the 1997 Edition of the 
Uniform Plumbing Code (UPC) to the City Council for adoption as the City’s 
Plumbing Code to replace the 1994 UPC.  The following amendments will also 
be recommended as part of the adoption process. 
 
Notification of this Council Meeting will be published in the Post Register and 
posted in City Hall.  In advance of that meeting, interested parties are invited to 
direct comments or questions to Russ Goyen, City Plumbing Inspector, at  
529-1273. 
 

AMENDMENTS RECOMMENDED FOR THE ADOPTION OF THE 1997 
UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE 

 
1. Section 101.4.1.4 Conflicts Between Codes – puts Plumbing Code over 

Mechanical in every case.  This may not always be desirable. 
Recommendation:  Delete this section, and handle conflicts on a case-
by-case basis. 
 

2. Section 103.4 Permit Fees – fees are already regulated by the Building 
Department fee schedule. 
Recommendation:  Delete this section. 
 

3. Section 103.4.2 Plan Review Fees – fee is already included in plan 
submittal process. 
Recommendation:  Delete this section. 
 

4. Section 1-1 Fee Schedule – same as Item No. 3. 



 

 

 
5. Section 218 Definition of Plumbing System – includes terms “medical 

gas and medical vacuum systems”.  These are not recommended to be 
included in the adoption of the Code – see Item No. 22 below. 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

Recommendation:  Delete “medical gas and medical vacuum systems” 
from Section 218. 
 

6. Section 409.1 Water Closets Suitable for Children Under 6 – “suitable” 
not defined.  This would leave room for arbitrary interpretation and 
subsequent enforcement difficulties. 
Recommendation:  Delete this Section. 
 

7. Section 412.2.1 Floor shall slope toward floor drain – this requirement 
involves other trades and the plumber has no control over these even 
when he sets the drain low enough. 
Recommendation:  Delete this Section (State Amendment.) 
 

8. Section 412.4 Same as Above. 
 

9. Section 413.0 Minimum Plumbing Facilities – this is covered in the 
Building Code, and its requirements are reasonable and sufficient, 
although some differences exist. 
Recommendation:  Delete this Section.  (State Amendment.) 
 

10. Table 4-1 Same as Above. 
 

11. Section 604.1 Materials – add:  Listed PE (polyethylene) water service 
piping may be installed within a building (above and below ground) with 
one joint.  (Brass insert adapter with 2 strap-type all stainless-steel 
bands over pipe.) 
Recommendation:  Add this language to be in line with State 
Amendment. 
 

12. Table 6-4 Fixture Unit Loading – calls for increases for bathtubs, 
combination bath/shower, domestic clothes washers and whirlpool baths 
from 2 FU to 4 FU.  
Recommendation:  Retain the values at 2 FU to be in line with the 
State. 
 

13. Table 6-5 Water Pipe Sizing – add:  Branch pipes up to 20 feet 
developed length may supply a maximum of 4 FU for ½” nominal pipe 
size, and a maximum of 16 FU for ¾” nominal pipe size. 
Recommendation:  Add change to be in line with State. 
 

14. Section 609.10 Water Hammer Arrestors – “quick-acting” not defined, 
and could be applied too broadly – even to single-lever faucets. 
Recommendation:  Delete this section. 
 

15. Table 7-3 Drainage Fixture Unit Loading – same as for Item No. 12. 
Recommendation:  Same as for No. 12.  Also, change trap-arm size for 
whirlpool bath and combination bath/shower to 1-1/2”. 
 



 

 

16. Section 704.2 Use of Double Fixture Fittings – State has amended to 
allow for use of sanitary crosses to pick up back-to-back or side-to-side 
fixtures rather than require the use of special double fixture fittings. 
Recommendation:  Adopt this change to be in line with State. 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

17. Table 7-5 Fixture Unit Loading for 1-1/2” Horizontal Drainage – State 
has amended to allow 2 FU. 
Recommendation:  Adopt this change to be in line with the State. 
 

18. Section 710.9 Dual Pumps for Public Use Sumps – This requires 
businesses to install expensive dual pump systems for even the simplest 
of plumbing facilities in basements with a high sewer. 
Recommendation:  Provide for exception where the pump or receiving 
tank receives the discharge of no more than one toilet room. 
 

19. Section 907.6 Increasing Required Vent Size for Frost or Snow 
Closure – This never has been needed in the City of Idaho Falls. 
Recommendation:  Delete this Section. 

20. Section 908.0 Horizontal Wet Venting – The State allows horizontal wet 
venting under specific conditions. 
Recommendation:  Add:  Horizontal wet venting shall be allowed 
provided the wet-vented portion is created in the vertical according to the 
requirements set forth in Section 908 for Vertical Wet Venting. 
 

21. Section 1101.5 – 1101.10 Subsoil Drains – This Section requires the 
installation of perimeter subsoil drains for all foundations.  Our climate 
has never necessitated the use of subsoil drains as a general 
requirement.  When special conditions might rarely require such drains, 
the architect or engineer could specify their installation. 
Recommendation:  Delete this Section. 
 

22. Chapter 13 Medical Gas – This Chapter in its entirety has been deleted 
by State Amendment. 
Recommendation:  Delete this Chapter. 
 

At the request of Councilmember Mills, the City Attorney read the following Ordinance by 
title: 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 2283 
 

AN ORDINANCE REPEALING AND RE-ENACTING 
SECTIONS 7-5-1 AND 7-5-2 OF THE CITY CODE OF 
IDAHO FALLS, IDAHO; PROVIDING FOR THE 
ADOPTION OF THE UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE, 
1997 EDITION; MAKING CERTAIN AMENDMENTS 
THERETO; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY; AND 
ESTABLISHING EFFECTIVE DATE. 
 

The foregoing Ordinance was presented by title only.  Councilmember Mills moved, and 
Councilmember Groberg seconded, that the provisions of Idaho Code Section 50-902 
requiring all Ordinances to be read by title, and once in full, on three separate dates be 
dispensed with and the Ordinance be passed on all three readings.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 



 

 

    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Branson 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Renée R. Magee, Planning and Building Director 
SUBJECT: STREET NAME CHANGE, LATAH AVENUE SOUTH OF U. S. 20 
 
Attached is a copy of the Ordinance to change the name of Latah Avenue from 
Vissing Street north to U. S. 20 to Vissing Street.  This Ordinance has been 
prepared and submitted at the request of the sole resident on this portion of 
Latah Avenue.  The Planning Department respectfully requests approval of this 
Ordinance, and it is now being submitted to the Mayor and City Council for 
consideration. 
 
        s/ Renée R. Magee 
 

At the request of Councilmember Mills, the City Attorney read the following Ordinance by 
title: 
 

ORDINANCE NO. 2284 
 

AN ORDINANCE CHANGING THE NAME OF LATAH 
AVENUE (FROM VISSING STREET TO U. S. 20), A 
STREET LOCATED WITHIN THE CITY OF IDAHO 
FALLS, TO VISSING STREET; PROVIDING WHEN 
THIS ORDINANCE SHALL BECOME EFFECTIVE. 
 

The foregoing Ordinance was presented by title only.  Councilmember Mills moved, and 
Councilmember Groberg seconded, that the provisions of Idaho Code Section 50-902 
requiring all Ordinances to be read by title, and once in full, on three separate dates be 
dispensed with and the Ordinance be passed on all three readings.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 
  The Public Works Director submitted the following memos: 



 

 

 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM : Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: PANCHERI DRIVE PROJECT, CHANGE ORDER NO. 6 
 
Attached is proposed Change Order No. 6 to the Pancheri Drive Project.  This 
Change Order is for metal reinforcement which was necessary to fit to actual 
field conditions.  The estimated amount of this Change Order, based upon 
quantity reduction, will decrease the Contract amount by $2,500.00. 
 
Public Works recommends approval of this Change Order; and, authorization 
for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to 
approve Change Order No. 6 to Idaho Construction Company for the Pancheri Drive Project 
and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the necessary 
documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: PANCHERI DRIVE PROJECT, CHANGE ORDER NO. 7 
 
Attached is proposed Change Order No. 7 to the Pancheri Drive Project.  This 
Change Order provides for irrigation and lighting power service and would 
increase the Contract amount by $816.00. 
 
Public Works recommends approval of this Change Order; and, authorization 
for the Mayor to sign the Contract Documents. 



 

 

 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to 
approve Change Order No. 7 to Idaho Construction Company for the Pancheri Drive Project 
and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the necessary 
documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 

 
        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: PANCHERI DRIVE PROJECT, CHANGE ORDER NO. 9 
 
Attached is proposed Change Order No. 9 to the Pancheri Drive Project.  This 
Change Order is for fabricating and supplying water line support brackets and 
increases the Contract amount by an estimated $5,461.03.  Originally, the City 
was to supply these brackets, but the placement changed and it is more cost 
effective to have the Contractor supply these items. 
 
Public Works recommends approval of this Change Order; and, authorization 
for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to 
approve Change Order No. 9 to Idaho Construction Company for the Pancheri Drive Project 
and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the necessary 
documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
 
  Nay:  None 
 



 

 

  Motion Carried. 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 20, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: EASTERN IDAHO RAILROAD AGREEMENT – WEST SIDE 
  GREENBELT PEDESTRIAN UNDERPASS 
 
Attached is a License Agreement between the City and Eastern Idaho Railroad 
which provides for the City’s use of a portion of the railroad right-of-way on the 
west bank of the Snake River, just south of Broadway.  This use is needed to 
construct an underpass beneath the railroad for the purpose of accommodating 
pedestrian traffic along the Greenbelt.  In turn, the Railroad has committed to 
use the fee paid by the City to rehabilitate certain railway grade crossings 
within the City. 
 
Public Works recommends approval of this License Agreement; and, 
authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to execute the documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to 
approve the License Agreement between the City of Idaho Falls and Eastern Idaho Railroad 
and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the necessary 
documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: ASPHALT OVERLAY OF STREETS – 1998 
  PROJECT NO. 0.00.00.0.STR.98.04 
 



 

 

On July 7, 1998, bids were received and opened for Asphalt Overlay of Streets, 
1998.  A tabulation of the bid results is attached. 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

Public Works recommends acceptance of the low bid provided by BECO 
Construction, Inc. in the amount of $221,280.00; and, authorization for the 
Mayor and City Clerk to sign the Contract Documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to accept 
the low bid from BECO Construction, Inc. to complete the Asphalt Overlay of Streets – 1998 
Project and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to execute the Contract 
Documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Branson 
 
  Nay:  None 
 

Motion Carried. 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: SOUTH BOULEVARD WATER AND SEWER IMPROVEMENTS 
  PROJECT NOS. 2.38.30.4.WTR.98.06 AND 2.38.30.4.SWR.98.07 
 
On July 14, 1998, bids were received and opened for South Boulevard Water 
and Sewer Improvements.  A tabulation and the bid results is attached. 
 
Public Works recommends acceptance of the low bid provided by HK 
Contractors, Inc. in the amount of $613,591.00; and, authorization for the 
Mayor and City Clerk to sign the Contract Documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to accept 
the low bid of HK Contractors, Inc. to complete the South Boulevard Water and Sewer 
Improvements Project and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign 
said Contract Documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Groberg 



 

 

    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
 
  Nay:  None 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: PAVING EQUIPMENT RENTAL – 1998 
  PROJECT NO. 0.00.00.0.STR.00.05 
 
On July 7, 1998, bids were received and opened for providing paving equipment 
with operators.  A tabulation of the bid results is attached. 
 
Public Works recommends acceptance of the low bid provided by TMC 
Contractors, Inc. in the amount of $40,475.00; and, authorization for the Mayor 
and City Clerk to sign the Contract Documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to accept 
the low bid provided by TMC Contractors, Inc. to provide the Paving Equipment Rental – 
1998 and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the Contract 
Documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 17, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: SEAL COATING – 1998 – PROJECT NO. 0.00.00.0.STR.98.03 
 
On July 7, 1998, bids were received and opened for Seal Coating – 1998.  A 
tabulation of the bid results is attached. 
 



 

 

Public Works recommends approval of the low bid provided by HK Contractors, 
Inc., in the amount of $99,252.50; and, authorization for the Mayor and City 
Clerk to sign the Contract Documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to accept 
the low bid of HK Contractors, Inc. to complete the Seal Coating – 1998 Project and, further, 
give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the Contract Documents.  Roll call as 
follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Groberg 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
 
  Nay:  None 
 

Motion Carried. 
 

        City of Idaho Falls 
        July 21, 1998 
 
MEMORANDUM 
 
TO:  Honorable Mayor and City Council 
FROM: Chad Stanger, Public Works Director 
SUBJECT: WEST SIDE GREENBELT – BROADWAY TO PANCHERI 
 
On July 20, 1998, bids were received and opened for the West Side Greenbelt – 
Broadway to Pancheri Project.  Attached is a tabulation of the bid results. 
 
Public Works recommends award to the low bidder Ricon, Inc. in the amount of 
$201,037.00; and, authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the 
Contract Documents. 
 
        s/ Chad Stanger 
 

It was moved by Councilmember Carlson, seconded by Councilmember Hardcastle, to accept 
the low bid of Ricon, Inc. to complete the West Side Greenbelt – Broadway to Pancheri Project 
and, further, give authorization for the Mayor and City Clerk to sign the Contract 
Documents.  Roll call as follows: 
 
  Aye:  Councilmember Branson 
    Councilmember Hardcastle 
    Councilmember Mills 
    Councilmember Eldredge 
    Councilmember Carlson 
    Councilmember Groberg 
 
  Nay:  None 
 
  Motion Carried. 
 



 

 

JULY 23, 1998 
___________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
  There being no further business, it was moved by Councilmember Carlson, 
seconded by Councilmember Eldredge, that the meeting adjourn at 9:05 p.m.  
 
 
 
________________________________________  _______________________________________ 
  CITY CLERK            MAYOR 
 

************************* 
 
 


